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1. Introduction 
Landscape change, has increasingly been recognized within interdisciplinary 
perspectives to be a process that is inherently influenced by an interacting social-
ecological system. This process is not deemed to be static, but rather it is a dynamic 
process of transaction between human values and functions that have evolved as a 
consequence of past resource use, policy and social response. The process of 
landscape creation as a human territorial region is described by Mumford (1938, 
p.367) as “a complex of geographic, economic and cultural elements. Not found as a 
finished product in nature, not solely the creations of human will… the region… is a 
collective work of art”. A human territorial region or a “place” is the sum of all 
interactions between human activity and preference, and biophysical resources, 
whereby a bioregion indicates a similar pattern of land use and ecosystem 
(Brunckhorst 2001; Slocombe, 1993) creating the social identity of that physical 
context (Shannon, 1998). Planning frameworks should embrace more pragmatic 
approaches towards the inclusion of values and meanings because planning decisions 
involve the negotiation of human habitation which can trigger uncertain future actions 
regarding land use. Stedman (2005) asserts that place attachment can be a catalyst 
determining the choice and activities in land use outcomes. In other words, 
negotiating the meaning of place by various social actors inevitably implies a different 
direction for future actions. Although it is indicated in some studies that while an 
attachment to a place substantially expresses a strong support to maintain the setting 
(e.g., Cheng et al., 2003), an understanding of the way in which the place should be 
perceived by various actors, may imply a different course of action that further 
determines the future of the spatial pattern (Stedman, 2005).The repositioning of our 
sense of place through bioregional thinking therefore is imperative, underlining its 
importance to nurture and empower human culture towards a positive landscape 
change. 
 
Land use planning, resource and biodiversity conservation under these circumstances 
suggest that these activities not only manage biophysical components, but also the 
negotiation of human territorial regions, which are composed of complex values, 
interactions and meanings. The literature in land use change commonly developed a 
spatially explicit model to assess a range of human drivers for change, for example 
environmental aspects (e.g., Wu et al., 2008), economic (e.g., Irwin & Geoghegan, 
2001), political and institutional influences (e.g., Clement et al., 2006), in addition to 
attitudinal considerations (e.g., Karali et al., 2011). While most of these factors 
recognized largely as involving definitive and measurable indicators, the less 
perceptible gauge of human well-being or satisfaction, the attachment to place, has 
received little attention. This type of value system is seen as less defensible as it is 
regarded as far more difficult to measure, with an “unseen” physical impact in 
managing sustainable land use practices.  Simply, “it is easier to oppose land uses 
when there is hard evidence that these practices will have tangible, measurable, 
objective and widespread impacts” (Stedman, 2005, p.121). The focus of this paper is 
that the exploration of sense of place should be an imperative to better understand 
how humans reorganize their response to environmental impacts. 
 
In this context, a question is posed- how are land use decisions rendered by the 
negotiation of the actors values, which then in turn shape the land use patterns and 
ecosystem services that will further be enjoyed by the communities at large? 
Landscape that embodies a multitude of values from amongst the social actors 
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predicts a different action outcome for land use decisions that subsequently shape 
future spatial patterning, influencing ecological functioning. In a study by Stedman 
(2005) these differences were observed whereby the impact of shoreline development 
on sense of place between two groups of property owners was assessed. The end 
result revealed that the degree of lakeshore development significantly influenced the 
resident’s considerations about their lake. While the property owners on lightly 
developed lake shores associated their sense of place with that of a pristine, natural-
based setting that is peaceful, this view for the residents on highly developed lake 
shores was held to a far lesser extent. The residents of highly developed lakes shores 
were more likely to consider their place as residential-suburbia, packed with related 
urban services and recreational opportunities with consequential pollution problems. 
The discrepancies between the different residents’ beliefs assert that human 
cognitions have a pivotal and measurable impact on future land use pattern. In a 
similar manner, a study by Lerner (2005) examined how attachment to a place 
empowered a community for a positive change against a local contamination issue. 
The study concluded how sense of place defines us and the environment through the 
process of the creation of ‘change maker’, a person that is empowered to make 
positive changes in regards to local land use issues through active participation. 
  
2. Bioregional Planning: Re-envisioning Humanities Role in Social-Ecological 

Systems 
The fundamental rethinking of natural resource management, conservation and 
reconciling human needs in land use planning has led to a paradigm shift from a 
rational planning approach towards alternative integrated planning approaches (Scrase 
& Sheate, 2002). In this age of complexity where the patterns of nature and society 
are interwoven into an interconnected web of domains and processes, many planning 
approaches struggle to frame the uncertainties of the future as a result of our actions 
today. Current advances in ecosystem sciences, sustainability sciences and other 
related disciplines acknowledge that socio-ecological systems are interlinked, creating 
an intertwined linkage of systems that are influenced by each other. Different 
approaches have been debated on how best to protect public interests. The failure of a 
traditional top-down planning approach has increasingly been noted by advocates in 
planning and environmental management fields (see for example; Blair, 1996; Scott, 
1998). In particular, it has been critiqued as being overly relied on in regards to the 
aspect of growth projection (Loveridge, 1972), the inability of local government to 
solve trans-boundary environmental problems associated with urban sprawl 
(Godschalk et al., 1977) and disempowerment of local communities in decision-
making (Harris, 1994). 
 
More importantly, Diffendefer & Birch (1997) claimed that these responses are rather 
symptomatic of the core issue of a centralized command and control approach, 
highlighting an inability to counteract against a utilitarian view of specific actors in 
satisfying their needs.  Furthermore, public dissatisfaction with government, has led to 
mistrust in science as a base for political decision-making (see for example; Gauchat, 
2012; Reynolds, 1969) which often does not reflect the concerns, values and needs of 
the communities (Moote & McClaran, 1997). Consequently this has necessitated a 
social restructuring of planning in order to manage effectively competing land use 
interests between various social actors (Frame et al., 2004). In the context of regional 
planning and conservation, bioregionalism offers an alternative approach for 
governance that involves both social and political restructuring. Birkeland (2008) and 

The Asian Conference on Sustainability, Energy and the Environment 2013 
Official Conference Proceedings Osaka, Japan

169



	
  
	
  

Diffendefer & Birch (1997) assert that the subsequent transformation of governance 
implies the need for a multi-faceted platform designed to achieve ecological 
conservation, which in turn facilitates social, ecological and economic sustainability.  
 
A more overt approach for the inclusion of sense of place in planning and 
conservation through bioregional planning is needed as a means of addressing these 
concerns. While bioregions, as defined earlier, are patterns of land use and 
biophysical similarities, they also emphasize the “terrain of consciousness” – a place 
where the inhabitants are aware and have their own ideas regarding their existence or 
thoughts concerning how to live in that place (Relph, 1976; Tuan, 1977). This in turn 
distinguishes bioregionalism from the ecoregional approach that is to a greater extent 
directed towards biodiversity conservation. Relevantly, while earlier fragmented 
research and planning field’s isolated society from resource use, bioregionalism under 
these conditions expresses the self-reliant characteristics of several multi-faceted 
components in the planning system. Sale (1993) noted that the core foundation of 
bioregionalism is the in-depth understanding of a region’s resources and geography, 
in which dynamic social and economic development operates within the ecological 
carrying capacity.  This philosophy underlines the importance of an ecological-
planning approach so as to be responsive to people who inhabit the place (Thayer, 
2003) and to enable community-empowerment in decision making (Harris, 1994) in 
order to facilitate and achieve long-term ecosystem conservation.  
 
The bioregional planning approach that is conveyed in this article aims to provide an 
integrated framework that will relate ecological imperatives alongside the social 
systems. While discussion on bioregional planning as a framework for land use 
planning, conservation and social reorganization (see discussion in Brunckhorst 
(2002) and Miller (1996)) is beyond the scope of this paper, we acknowledge that the 
framework shares a common ground among the various definitions, that is, 
bioregional planning recognizes both the natural environment and human societies as 
dynamic components of the landscape. Subsequently, the implication for bioregional 
planning is as an integrated ecosystem management system, where plans for 
conservation and maintenance of ecological integrity depend on sustaining human 
processes and vice-versa through co-operative decision-making (Berkes & Folke, 
1998; Bunch et al., 2011; Cumming, 2011).  
 
The foundation of bioregional theory amalgamates human and ecological needs as 
applied in the ecological land use planning paradigm (McHarg, 1995). However, 
bioregions are also perceived as a place, acknowledging the influence of collective 
public vision in the development of place and accordingly desire to maintain the 
ecosystem (Brunckhorst, 2001). This paper proposes to elaborate further on the 
association between a sense of place as a social process and how this process 
influences social actions of conservation and development policies. The two main 
thematic notions of bioregions as a transformation of place, and environmental 
stewardship which empowers communities will be deconstructed and a conceptual 
model will be proposed that illustrates the role of people-place collaboration in 
achieving social and ecological sustainability within the context of bioregionalism. 
 
3. Grounding a Sense of Place in Bioregional Planning 
A bioregional planning approach explicitly addresses the need for conservation 
planning in maintaining ecological processes and functions. Scientific knowledge of 
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landscape ecology underlines the set of principles used in modifying the spatial 
organization of the landscape when achieving balanced performance-based ecosystem 
outcomes. This may differ from the socio-cultural context, within which opinions, 
perceptions and values that are attached to particular landscapes are contingent on 
changes of the biophysical components. This dual perspective of conceptualizing the 
environment is crucial, as the scientific view of organizing the landscape is coupled 
with real community involvement in the planning process. In reality social opinion is 
not always aligned with the intended outcomes of conservation planning. Therefore, 
this poses a challenge for planners when considering the dualistic realm of an 
environmental model such as that described by Rappaport cited in Ndubisi (2002, pp. 
111-112): 
 

“Two models of the environment are significant in ecological 
studies; the operational and cognitive. The operational model is that 
which the anthropologist (scientist, planner, designer) constructs 
through observation and measurement of ecological entities, events 
and material relationship. He takes this model to present analytical 
purposes, the physical world of the group he is studying…. The 
cognized model is the model of environment conceived by people 
who act in it…The important question concerning the cognized 
model, since it serves as guide to action, is not the extent to which it 
conforms to reality (is identical to operational model) but the extent 
to which it elicits behaviour that is appropriate to the material 
situation of the actors, and it is against this function and adaptive 
criterion that we may assess it” 

 
Humans enter into the ecological system by being incorporated as another set of 
values or determinants (Cosens, 2013; Uy & Shaw, 2013). The cognitive model 
reflects on how people conceptualize and participate in the landscape by creating a 
specific meaning or value associated with the idea of ‘ecosystem’. Within the context 
of this study, this phenomenon is underpinned by the “transactional concept” and the 
“interactionism perspective”. Zube (1987) coined the idea “transactional concept” in 
order to explain human-landscape relationships by suggesting the notion that “both 
the human and the landscape change as a function of the transactions” (p.38). He 
suggested that active social participation and exploration in nature, creates an 
experience that contributes to the attribution of value towards nature. From the 
discipline of sociology, Greider & Garkovich (1994, p. 1) argue that landscape is the 
process of social construction in nature and: 
 

“Are the symbolic environments created by human acts of conferring 
meaning to nature and the environment, of giving the environment 
definition and form from a particular angle of vision and through a 
special filter of values and beliefs” 

 
These theories conceptualize human-nature interaction where the human is an active 
participant in seeking, processing and making judgments about the landscape that 
generates affinity or attachment to a particular place manifested by a unique set of 
cultural, belief or norms.  
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Translating this interaction of human and nature within bioregionalism, these theories 
imply that societal outcomes when managing ecosystems are not dictated by the 
biophysical process, but rather are guided by the spatial organization of the landscape 
built upon ecosystem sciences in such a way that it fulfills both social and biophysical 
objectives. As a result of this developmental process, “sense of place” emerges as an 
overarching concept that encapsulates values and meanings that explain the intricate 
relationship between land and people. Planning considered as a process “founded on 
the need to deliver human experience” underlines the complexity of negotiating 
public values and meanings (Knopf, 1983, p. 229). The implications of ignoring this 
experience may include influencing the way people react or behave, either positively 
or negatively in that place setting. As bioregionalism stresses the notion of people 
knowing the “place” in which they live, it is crucial to understand the process of how 
a place is developed from the human interaction with biophysical components. 
 
4. Sense of Place 
The subject of place as an experiential place or ‘sense of place’ has been explored 
from various disciplinary perspectives bounded by their own epistemological 
foundation in conceptual understanding. Early development in geography indicated 
place as a locale of physical properties in a geographical context (Lew, 2008). Since 
then, humanistic geography studies have enriched the concept by suggesting that 
place is not merely a physical entity but it is composed of complex experiential and 
psychological dimensions attached to a particular physical continuum. This particular 
discourse is endowed by humanistic geographers such as Relph (1996) asserting that 
place is not just a mere connection to physical properties of the natural environment 
but rather “tightly interconnected assemblages of buildings, landscapes, communities, 
activities, and meanings which are constituted in diverse experiences of their 
inhabitants and visitors" (p. 907-8). Drawing upon this phenomenological experience, 
he further suggests that development of place not only evolves from individual-
meaning, but is presented as a collective form of intersubjective, shared values 
communicated between inhabitants (Relph, 1996). Such complexity in conceiving and 
establishing clear development of place has been highlighted by Butz & Eyles (1997) 
as “rooted in theories of social organization and society, and as being variably and 
contingently ecologically emplaced” (p.1).  
 
Considering these circumstances, ‘a sense of place’ is therefore associated with the 
idea of experience that turns the ecosystem space into a place. Tuan (1977) in his 
seminal work pointed out that space turns into place "as we get to know it better and 
endow it with value" (p. 6). In a similar manner, Relph (1996) suggests ‘a sense of 
place’ is an awareness of the "inherent and unique qualities of somewhere" (p. 909). 
Implicitly, this understanding imposes a dimension of awareness or sense that 
qualities (environment or social) can be achieved and maintained (Tuan, 1980). In 
other words, ‘sense of place’ is composed of "personal memory, community history, 
physical landscape appearance, and emotional attachment" (Galliano & Loeffler, 1999 
p. 2). Places therefore, in addition to a physical setting, are an amalgamation of 
meanings and values, (Sampson & Goodrich, 2009) and socio-psychological 
processes (Gieryn, 2000; Stedman, 2002). Consequently, clarifying the qualities that 
can be classified as subjective to the meaning of anything – culture, own identity, 
imagination or memory and so physical or social properties when describing one’s 
‘sense of place’ and therefore presents certain challenges.  
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Despite the complexity of theory and practice in place-related research, the theoretical 
construct of ‘sense of place’ has been divided into two main lines of inquiry. The first 
approach conceptualizes three components of ‘sense of place’, constructed as place 
dependence, place identity and place attachment that overlap each other in one 
instance and subsequently override each other in another (Proshansky et al., 1983; 
Vaske &Kobrin, 2001; Williams & Roggenbuck, 1989). Alternatively, others have 
viewed ‘sense of place’ as a tripartite of three multidimensional constructs, with each 
construct representing the component of cognitive, emotive and conative of human 
consciousness (Steadman, 2002; Jorgensen & Stedman, 2006). Organizing these 
constructs in alignment with human consciousness, place identity can be 
conceptualized as the cognitive component while place dependence is associated with 
the conative component and place attachment as the emotive component of sense of 
place. Place identity according to Proshanky (1978) refers to an intersection of 
personal values, beliefs and goals within the physical setting, and hence an idea of 
how a physical setting becomes purposeful and meaningful to life. While place 
dependence is a functional relationship illustrated when a place is instrumental in 
fulfilling certain needs of the individual (Stedman, 2002), place attachment on the 
other hand reflects the emotive part of awareness, thus positive bonding develops 
between the individual and their natural world (Altman & Low, 1992).  
 
Environmental psychologists have used place attachment as the denominator for a 
sense of place in their theory development and practice and their approach presents a 
stark contrast to epistemological and research approaches (Graham et al., 2009, p.15). 
Their primary focus has been on investigating the psychological process of mental 
cognition/development of an individual’s connection within the physical context. This 
range of researchers has emerged concurrently with the objective to inform the 
behavioural process in planning. Altman & Low (1992) define place attachment as 
''the symbolic relationship formed by people giving culturally shared 
emotional/affective meanings to a particular space or piece of land that provides the 
basis for the individual's and group's understanding of and relation to the environment” 
(p. 165). A symbolic relationship is experienced at the scale of individual, group or 
culture inculcation, through “interplay of affect and emotions, knowledge and beliefs, 
and behaviours and actions in reference to a place" (Altman & Low, 1992, p.4). 
However, the study of place attachment in environmental psychology has been 
criticized for its sole emphasis on the psychological process of development of place 
(Sime, 1995). In contrast, humanistic geography emphasizes the phenomenological 
experiences of how people understand places and shape the role places play in their 
life, while research into environmental psychology has tended to separate the 
composite experiential of place into discrete elements that are measured in a positivist 
approach.  
 
Nonetheless, the contribution of place attachment and identity in environmental 
psychology has been widely accepted in planning practice due to its ability to 
conceptualize the emotive bonds between people and place- a subject that many 
planning realms strive hard to manage. Regardless of various disciplinary orientations 
in understanding place, they are underpinned by the core principle of human beings 
embedded in a particular environmental context that involves interaction of 
experience and physical components. Therefore it is intended that this article will 
employ ‘sense of place’ as a broad concept that is assumed to capture the tripartite 
construct of place attachment, place identity and place dependence rather than 
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articulating the constructs into distinct individual elements (e.g., Rollero & De Piccoli, 
2010). Sense of place therefore refers to the people-place connection manifested via 
collective memories, values and history of culture as reflected by, and influencing, the 
physical context. 
 
5. Bioregional Planning: Sense of Place Nurturing and Empowering Positive 

Landscape Change 
Environmental stewardship is a one of the core principles of community planning 
articulated in bioregionalism as people who live in a specific place, consciously 
developing their own idea and way of living in relation to that particular place. As 
outlined earlier, disintegration of people and place in the rational planning approaches 
disempowers community members from their civic role and responsibility towards the 
protection of their living environment. In contrast it is apparent that developing the 
competency of community-based-decision-making is founded on residential 
understanding of local resources availability. Bioregionalism under these 
circumstances becomes a decentralized planning exercise, underscoring the 
importance of economic and politic decision-making to be delegated at a local level, 
which inherently gives rise to personal and community empowerment (Harris, 1994). 
Moreover, community empowerment is translated into active participation in 
decision-making that fosters a shared learning process – a quality legitimated by the 
interaction between experiential and technical knowledge (Aberley, 1993; Diffendefer 
& Birch, 1997).   
 
Such mobilization of empowerment is determined importantly by understanding the 
connection of humans with their natural world and stewardship of the land. The 
emphasis on consideration of human connection and values in planning potentially 
can be the turning point for more directive actions towards a resilient social-
ecological system. Concurring with bioregional thinking, it advocates the re-
envisioning of people-place relationship translated into “repairing…the damage done 
to natural systems, and recreating human cultures capable of flourishing in an 
ecologically sustainable manner through time” (Plant & Plant cited in DePrez, 1997, p. 
43). Human culture in this sense is parallel to the land ethics that Aldo Leopold 
espouses, which works toward intensifying the sense of care, commitment and 
concern of how the place should be. He eloquently suggests that in developing a land 
ethic, the role of humanity is transformed from conqueror of ecological system to an 
egalitarian view that a human is “just plain member and citizen of it” (Leopold, 1949, 
p.240). He further asserts that culture which then drives societal action can be 
assessed in relation to one’s connection or association to the natural world: 
 

“A thing is right when it tends to maintain the integrity, stability, 
and beauty of biotic community, it is wrong when it tends otherwise” 
(Leopold, 1949, p. 266). 

 
One of his supporters, Worrell & Appleby (2000) suggest that environmental 
stewardship is a form of land ethic, defining it as a deeply held moral obligation 
interpreted into actions of “responsible use (including conservation) of natural 
resources in a way that takes full and balanced account of the interests of society 
(and) future generations … as well as private needs, and accepts significant 
answerability to society” (p. 269). Considering that society must confront 
multifaceted issues related to land management, a compelling question arises. In what 
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way are social actions directed towards achieving social, economic and ecological 
sustainability? It has been suggested that the land ethic should provide a conceptual 
foundation for environmental stewardship that can guide the action and response of 
society towards the threat of ecosystem degradation and resources depletion (Knight, 
1996). This segment will articulate and characterize certain qualities promoted by 
ethical social action that would qualify as environmental stewardship, which is 
initiated from planning and conservation decisions. 
 
The majority of research into planning, resource management, environment and 
behaviour have made connections between place-based values and stewardship, 
although in each case it has been explored within its own paradigm. Studies in 
landscape and urban planning for example, have explored the role of local resident 
attachment to rural and urban landscapes in determining their motivation for 
stewardship and land protection (Lokocz et al., 2011; Walker & Ryan, 2008). These 
studies have found strong connections between place attachment and stewardship 
engagement. This quality is manifested through several forms of supportive attitude 
towards conservation strategies that promote ecological stability. Inasmuch, this 
presents evidence that residents are more concerned about their connection to place by 
sustaining the local economic and landscape character. Studies have shown that social 
actions through several mechanisms in development planning directly contribute to 
social embeddedness in a physical context. Cantrill (1998) indicates that ‘sense of 
place’ constitutes a major role in influencing individual capacity and involvement in 
environmental advocacy for sustainable resource policies. Their ability to practice 
attitudes which heighten the protection of ecosystems is underlined by awareness of 
place-based knowledge. Kruger & Shannon (2000) assert that citizens who developed 
awareness of their local context seem to “grasp the opportunity to create knowledge, 
benefits, and new opportunities for social action” (p. 475).  
 
Drawing on literature in environmental psychology and behaviour, volunteer 
motivation for engaging in stewardship programs have been demonstrated to depend 
on whether they can view it as a process of social learning, care-taking of the 
environment, as well as developing sense of belonging to that place, or not (Bramston 
et al., 2010). Over and above people-place relationship theory, other studies have 
explored this concept through the lens of community attachment – how socially based 
attachment determines attitudes about local environmental issues (Brehm et al, 2006; 
Stewart et al., 2004). This line of research distinguishes between socially based 
bonding relating to physical attachment, and the emphasis placed on community-level 
attachment on environmental concerns. 
 
As the people-place connection is inextricably embedded in the ecosystem context, 
previous studies suggest emotional bonding with the place can mediate the way 
people respond and react to ecosystem change through several mechanisms. For 
example, people who exhibit a strong sense of place demonstrate more commitment 
to problem solving and are more likely to react to environmental issues. This is a 
predictor of a resilient characteristic of dynamic landscape change (Burley et al., 
2007; Kaltenborn & Bjerke, 2002; Lai & Kreuter, 2012). These studies have 
suggested that the role of communities within themselves can participate and make 
clear how the policy should be oriented towards their needs. Pertinent to that, resident 
acceptance of proposed landscape changes are inclined to legitimize and enhance their 
meaning of place in the planning process (Stewart et al., 2004). This finding for 
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example, was underlined by Steadman (2002) where place-based values are 
incorporated into the decision-making process, where it creates a protective behaviour 
that seeks to maintain and enhance values attributed to place – actions that reveal the 
importance of the place. Similarly, Vaske & Kobkrin (2001) found that local 
attachment to natural resources could be a valuable mechanism to predict whether an 
individual acts in an environmentally responsible manner (or not). These studies, 
when applied within various fields related to environmental policy-making, have 
demonstrated that the people-place connection and community attachment have 
played a significant role in guiding specific social actor behavioural responses, either 
positively or negatively, to environmental decision-making.  
 
6. Summary & Operationalization  
Figure 1 proposes a conceptual model linking sense of place with social and 
ecological sustainability. This model illustrates sense of place as a concept of a social 
process that helps make conservation and development policies viable by 
acknowledging the values and meanings of humans. It captures the idea that 
ecosystem functioning evolves as a result of human understanding of the place across 
social structure and institutions; specifically, it is manifested in an amalgamation of 
social attitudes and behaviours in influencing land use outcomes. This article argues 
that individual and community empowerment is developed from the connection to the 
place within which they are embedded, and this serves as a basis for developing an 
ethical and moral responsibility for actions mobilized by stewardship to the land. 
 

 
Figure 1: Conceptual model linking the core premise that the people-place 
relationship fulfils an important role in achieving social and ecological sustainability. 
An experience of a place might be developed over a given time period and changes of 
environmental. 
 
Drawing upon this conceptual model, several compelling questions arise for further 
study; (1) How do individuals and communities develop a sense of place? (2) Is there 
any variance in the strength of sense of place among social actors, e.g., individuals, 
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professionals and other stakeholders in land management? (3) How do variations in 
the sense of place influence the effect of environmental stewardship? (4) How does 
environmental stewardship empower communities in their actions and attitudes 
towards environmental protection policies? (5) How do these responses feed back into 
the ecological system, through behavioural actions that determine the land use 
outcomes shaping the ecosystem functioning? As stressed in this article, bioregional 
planning envisions the place of people-place relationship in its core foundation to 
characterize specific emergence of social behavior in planning decisions. This re-
positions the human dimension in integrated ecosystem management, suggesting an 
alternative path to the sustainability of socio-ecological systems especially in dealing 
with the uncertain future of our plans today. The evolution of an ecosystem is partly 
but crucially determined by what we identify as important for the next generation to 
enjoy including the ecosystem services that we are experiencing now. In conclusion, a 
sense of place is a concept that people use to conceptualize themselves into the 
ecological system and plays a powerful role in influencing and distinguishing actions 
across social actors in land management.  
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