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Abstract 
The purpose of this study was to examine the effectiveness of cognitive behavioral 
therapy group counseling in reducing both anger and aggression among male 
prisoners. A pre-test and post-test research design was used to compare the 
effectiveness of cognitive behavior between groups. A total of 20 prisoners 
participated in this study. The subjects were randomly assigned into experimental 
group (N=10) and control group (N=10).  The experimental group received eight 
sessions of group counseling while control group did not receive any treatment.  The 
State -Trait Anger Expression Inventory-2 (STAXI- 2) and Aggression Questionnaire 
(AQ) were used to measure anger and aggression behavior. Using ANCOVA, the 
results have indicated significant differences in anger scales between the experimental 
and control group, except for anger expression-in, anger control-out, and anger 
control-in. The results have also shown significant differences in aggression between 
groups. The implications of the findings and suggestions for future research are 
discussed.  
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Introduction 
 
Emotions are a state characterized by physiological arousal and changes in facial 
expression, gestures, posture, and subjective feelings (Coon & Mitterer, 2010).  Life 
without emotions may feel empty and meaningless, because emotions shape our 
relationship and colour our daily activities. By providing a signal indication of the 
level of internal and our intentions, emotions can influence on how people act and 
react to others. Emotions are often associated with rational or irrational behavior. For 
instance anger is one of the primary emotions that can cause irrational behavior. Other 
primary emotions, including surprise, anticipation, trust, and joy (Plutchik, 2003), 
would lead to rational behavior.  All these emotions are universal emotions and an 
incredibly important part of our lives.  
 
Anger, though a basic human emotion, has received much less attention in the 
emotion literature than other areas such as depression, satisfaction, and fear. Anger is 
a normal feeling experienced irrespective of age, ethnicity, culture, and religion 
(Koellhoffer, Murphy & Banas, 2008). Most adults will experience anger episodes 
every single day (Kassinove & Tafrate, 2006).  The action of anger, for instance, is to 
try harder, to aggress, or both, which is appropriate to the eliciting condition of an 
active plan being frustrated. Thus, anger may become negative based on its frequency, 
intensity, and expressive behavior (DiGuiseppe & Tafrate, 2007). Higher anger 
intensity and frequency will lead to harmful effects of unmanaged and uncontrolled 
anger on both individuals and people. In other words, anger sometimes promotes an 
effort to inflict pain or harm on the offending other (Carver & Harmon-Jones, 2009). 
Therefore, information about anger helps the individuals to seek for therapy and is 
also an important resource that can help counselors redesign anger therapy.  
 
Anger will not arise for any reasons that cause a person to feel angry. Several factors 
may lead to anger, such as injustice, inequality, dissatisfaction with others, and so on 
(Marby & Kiecolt, 2005). Anger is also caused by frustration and stress experienced 
due to the rapid pace of technology and the increasing of socio-economic status 
(Orloff, 2009). Relating anger with negative psychosocial and interpersonal 
consequences, various studies report that lack of social support, interpersonal 
difficulties, lack of coping skills, and mental health problems (Kroner & Reddon, 
1995; Kassinove & Sukhodolsky, 1995; Lochman, Barry & Pardini, 2003) have all 
been shown to significantly contribute to anger. Anger is not only linked to negative 
psychological consequences but also increases vulnerability to physical illnesses, 
compromises the immune system, increases pain, and increases the risk of death from 
cardiovascular disease (Suinn, 2001; Chida & Steptoe, 2009).   
 
The inability to address growing anger can be seen as a result of the occurrence of 
crimes and aggression. Individuals with higher anger may become involved in 
physical and verbal attacks against the objects or other people. Some individuals may 
aggressively act in expressing anger such as sabotage, starting rumours, pouting, 
stalling, and disrupting the actions of others (Deffenbacher, 2011). Even people with 
high anger are more than double to engage in some types of negative verbal 
responses, act physically aggressive, and use substances (Tafrate, Kassinove & 
Dundin,  2002). However, reports from previous studies suggested that anger does not 
always lead to aggression.  



Aggression is a behavioral act resulting in harming or hurting others.  Aggression is 
commonly viewed as either proactive or reactive; overt (assault) or covert (theft); or 
physical, verbal, or relational (Lochman et al., 2010) while anger is a negative, 
phenomenological feeling state that motivates desires for actions, usually against 
others, that aim to warn, intimidate, control, or attack, or gain retribution (Kassinove 
& Tafrate, 2006). 
 
Several studies have found that most of prisoners, especially those who were involved 
in crime and drug addictions, were found to be emotionally imbalanced (Udrow, 
2008; Chan, 2009). One of the emotional imbalanced among them was, anger which 
is difficult to control (Vannoy & Hoyt, 2004 ; Udrow, 2008; Chan, 2009). As a result, 
anger will affect their actions and behavior, eventually leading to involvement in 
aggressive criminal activities (Akbari et al., 2012; Udrow, 2008). Chan (2009) 
suggested that most of the prisoners who were involved in criminal activities were 
unable to control their anger and were more aggressive.  
 
Emotional upset and anger can incite the individual act aggressively, which they are 
involved in crimes such as murder (Pincus, 2001), domestic violence (Norlander & 
Eckhardt, 2005; Murrell, Christoff & Henning, 2007), child abuse (Slep & O’Leary, 
2007; Stith et al., 2009) drug addiction, rape (Kellaway, 2009), destructive and violent 
crime (Del Vecchio & O’Leary, 2004; Novaco, 1997). Byrne et al. (2001) proposed 
that expressing anger is the strongest prediction of aggression among prisoners and it 
relates to physical violence.  Mills, Kroner & Forth (1998) also noted that the high 
measurement over anger was associated with inmates who engage in crime violence 
when compared with inmates who were not involved in crime violence. Furthermore, 
mean trait, anger out and anger in scores were significantly higher in prisoners with 
criminal recidivism in comparison with those who did not have prior criminal records 
(Corapcioglu & Erdogan, 2004). One study conducted by Norlander & Eckhardt 
(2005) showed that men who were act violently aggressive towards their partners 
have higher levels of hostility and anger than that of men who were not violent but 
also have problems or disagreements in close relationship with their partners.  
 
Reports from previous studies suggested that anger contributes to offending behavior 
and behavioral difficulties in relation to prison environments. In one study, prisoners 
reported two episodes of anger per week during the initial stages of their 
incarceration. Results showed that the duration of incarceration was positive 
significantly contributed to anger experiences (Zamble & Porporino, 1990). This 
explained that if anger is a stable mood experience therefore the present feature of 
long-term imprisonment appeared to be robust (Bonta & Gendreau, 1990). The 
correctional institutions have numerous stressful elements in their environments and 
prisoners may endure stressors such as limited physical space, with high walls and 
with a long history of violence (Thomas & Jackson,  2003), minimal personal space 
(Lawrence & Andrews, 2004), perceived threats of violence (Cesaroni & Peterson-
Badali, 2005), and lack of social support from significant others, family, and friends 
(Jiang, Fisher-Giorlando & Mo, 2005). Such conditions are very stressful at any time, 
and all can affect the individual’s mental health. So, those prisoners who lack of 
coping strategies may resort to manage the situation in unhealthy ways (Harreveld et 
al., 2007) such as violence, aggression, and other defiant behaviors (Zamble & 
Porporino, 1990). 
 



Treating individual with anger and aggression has been an increasing concern to 
health organizations, clinicians, and professional mental health. Many psychological 
intervention programs have been developed in offer the best practice in helping those 
people overcome their anger and aggression. For example, group counseling or group 
therapy have been found to be highly effective intervention programs when compared 
with individual counseling in encouraging recovery among male inmates (Ireland, 
2004), sex offenders (DeAngelis, 1992), juvenile offenders (Claypoole, Moody & 
Peace, 2000; Leone, Quinn & Osher, 2002), and female inmates (Niregi, 2003). This 
group counseling or group therapy provides an outlet for prisoners to share their 
thoughts and feelings about their past criminal activities. The group may help the 
prisoners to learn, share or release their thoughts and feelings in an appropriate ways 
without hurting themselves or others (Winterowd, Morgan & Ferrell, 2001).  For 
example, one of the group therapy program is anger management. (Edmondson & 
Conger, 1996). It has been implemented in western prison since the 1980's (Law, 
1997). The goals of anger management program are to reduce violence, aggressive 
behavior, and criminal behavior following release. The majority of anger management 
has been conducted based on the cognitive behavioral approach (Hunter, 1993).  
 
Evidence has shown that the group cognitive behavioral therapy has a greater effect 
on anger and aggression among prisoners. Findings also show a decrease in anger 
levels and aggression in experimental group after intervention among prisoners 
(Chan, 2009 ; Goldstein et al., 2012) and drug offenders (McLoughin, 2000) when 
compared with control group. 
 
In contrast, Howells et al. (2005) conducted a study of male prisoners in the 
Correctional Centre Australia showed that there were no statistical differences 
between treatment group and control group. They found a low impact of anger 
management on male prisoners especially in terms of intensity and frequency of 
anger.  However, the results revealed that the prisoners who participated in anger 
management program showed significantly greater improvement in anger knowledge 
than prisoners in the control group. 
 
Feindler & Byers (2006) proposed that cognitive behavioral therapy be used to treat 
automatic anger reactions.  Both group leaders and clients work together to create 
avoidance strategies for anticipated triggers and to encourage the purposeful 
employment of escape manoeuvres.  A variety of exercises have been designed to 
gradually expose the clients to anger situations and condition the clients in responses 
to anger situations in order to decrease the client’s physiological arousal and also to 
interrupt their habitual responses to anger situation.    
 
Tafrate & Kassinove (2006) stated that clients will learn to associate a new competing 
response to the triggers of their anger and to pair those triggers with new responses 
such as relaxation, cognitive coping statements, assertiveness skills, and the ability to 
remain quiet and not to respond others (timeout). They believe that through the 
repeated exposure to their anger triggers, clients will experience habituation and 
extinction and with repeated rehearsals and practices, clients can bring these new 
responses from sessions to the ultimate real world. One example of the cognitive 
behavioral therapy is cognitive restructuring. This therapy is used to identify and 
challenge harmful thoughts. The clients then were asked to rationalize their thoughts 
concerning identified situations (Feindler & Byers, 2006).  



Another example is assertive technique. This technique helps clients communicate 
appropriately. The clients are encouraged to be assertive rather than aggressive. 
Progressive muscle relaxation and breathing relaxation are also another common 
therapy to help the clients in controlling anger and managing anger. 
 
Limited research has examined the effectiveness of cognitive behavioral therapy in 
Malaysia. Up until now, most studies focused on social and psychological factors of 
anger and aggression among children and adolescents who were living in residential 
child care under the Child Protection Act 2001 of Malaysia or court orders, college or 
university students, and community samples. Prisoners are very rarely studied, 
although there is evidence that the prevalence of anger and aggression has shown 
higher rates. Thus, this study aims to examine the effectiveness of cognitive 
behavioral therapy group counseling on anger and aggression among prisoners in 
Malaysia. 
 
Methodology 
 
Research Design 
This study was tested using a quasi-experimental study designs with a pre-test and 
post-test control group design. 
 
Participants  
A total of 20 male adult prisoners participated in this study. The subjects were 
randomly assigned into experimental group (N=10) and control group (N=10). 
Participants were referred by correctional officers. All prisoners were involved with 
minor criminal offenses such as fighting, inflicted injuries, robbery, assault with a 
weapon, and similar offenses.   
 
Instruments 
Two instruments have been used in this study to measure anger and aggression. The 
State Trait Anger Expression Inventory-2 (STAXI 2; Spielberger, 1991) was used to 
measure anger. The STAXI-2 is a self-report measure which uses a 4-point rating 
scale to assess both the intensity of anger at a particular time and the frequency with 
which anger is experienced, expressed, and controlled.  This instrument consists of six 
main scales namely, state anger, trait anger, anger expression-out, anger expression- 
in, anger control-out, and anger control-in. The Aggressive Questionnaire (AQ; Buss 
& Perry, 1992) was used to measure aggression.  
 
Procedure  
The experimental group received eight sessions of cognitive behavioral therapy group 
counseling. Each session runs for about 150 minutes, twice a week.  Meanwhile the 
control group did not receive any treatment. The sessions of the treatment were 
constructed as follows:  
 
Session  1 : Introduce and rapport 
Session  2 : Overview of anger and aggression 
Session  3 : Event and cues of anger and the aggression cycle 
Session  4 : Anger Control Plan 
Session  5 : Cognitive Restructuring  
Session  6 : Assertiveness 



Session  7:  Model Resolution Conflict  
Session  8 : Termination 
 
Data Analysis 
 
Analysis were carried out using Statistical Package for Social Science (SPSS) 
software version 18.  Univariate Analysis of Covariance (ANCOVA) statistical 
analysis was used to analyse the data. 
 
Results 
 
Tables 1 and 2 shown below are the result of pre and post scores on anger main scales 
and aggression.  Results showed that there were no differences between mean of pre-
test for all anger main scales in two groups (table 1). However post-test in 
experimental group shows significant differences on state anger, trait anger and anger 
expression-out where the means were reduced from 39.20 to 28.70 (state anger), from 
23.70 to 19.80 (trait anger) and from 17.40 to14.60 (anger expression-out). On the 
other hand, there were no significant differences on anger expression-in, anger 
control-out and anger control-in. Post-test control groups also did not show significant 
differences on anger main scales.  
 
Results also showed that there is no difference between mean of pre-test for 
aggression between two groups (table 2). However, the mean of post-tests in 
experimental group shows that there is a significant difference, as the means were 
reduced from 85.40 to 68.50.  
 
Table 1:  Mean Pre and Post Scores on Anger Main Scales by Experimental and      

Control Group 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



Table 2:  Mean Pre and Post Scores on Aggression by Experimental and Control 
Group 
 

 
 
ANCOVA was used to examine the differences on anger scores between experimental 
group and control group. Results showed significant differences between pre-tests and 
post-tests between experimental group and control group on three anger main scales 
which the results showed state anger F(1,17) = 14.940, p < .05,  trait anger F(1,17) = 
9.143, p < . 05 and anger expression-out F (1,17) = 12.104, p < .05 (table 3).  It 
showed that the experimental group was effective to reduce state anger, trait anger, 
and anger expression-out comparing control group. However, there were no 
significant differences between the groups on anger expression-in scale F(1,17) = 
.023, p > .05, anger control-out scale  F(1,17) = .050, p > .05 and anger control-in 
scale F(1,17) = .003, p > .05 (table 3). 
 
Further analysis was then carried out to examine the differences on aggression scores. 
ANCOVA showed there were significant differences in pre-test and post-test between 
experimental group and control group on aggression.  F(1,17) = 8.670, p < .05 (table 
4). This shows that the treatment was effective at reducing aggression among 
intervention groups.  
 
 
Table 3: ANCOVA Analysis of Anger Main Scales in Pre-Test and Post-Test in 

Experimental  Group and Control Group 
 

 
 
* p< .05; ** p< .01  
 
 
 



Table 4: ANCOVA Analysis of Aggression in Pre-Test and Post-Test in Experimental 
Group and Control Group  

 

 
 
** p< .01; * p< .05 
 
Discussion and Conclusions  
 
Our findings showed significant differences between the experimental group and 
control group on the anger main scales such as state anger, trait anger, anger 
expression-out, and also on aggression. These findings support the results of previous 
studies carried out by previous researchers which stated that group intervention 
especially in cognitive behavioral reduces anger and aggression among prisoners in 
correctional settings (Goldstein, 2012; Chan, 2009; Ireland, 2004). Our findings 
suggest that the cognitive behavioral group therapy counseling is an effective 
approach to reduce anger and aggression.  This is in line with Pearson et al. (2002) 
findings when they discovered that 69 research studies on behavioral and cognitive 
behavioral programs. They found cognitive behavioral were more effective in 
reducing recidivism than behavioral therapy alone. Ireland (2004), for instance, 
examined the effectiveness of cognitive behavioral therapy for anger management 
group with young male offenders suggested that anger management in both observed 
angry behavior and self-reported angry behaviors were improved among treatment 
groups than that of control group.  
 
However, in our study, results showed there were no significant differences on three 
anger main scales such as anger expression-in, anger control-out and anger control-in. 
We suggested that the prisoners still especially experience difficulty to control their 
anger. This perhaps may relate to lack of motivation and social support among 
prisoners. Our findings are consistent with other findings (see Howells et al., 2005; 
Heseltine, Howells & Day, 2010). We also suggested that perhaps group anger 
management contributed to a small effect to the treatment groups. Therefore, no 
significance differences between anger expression-in, anger control-out and control-in 
among the experimental and control groups of prisoners were found.  
 
The non-significance result was due to poor motivation in prisoners. Readiness and 
motivation also proved to be a consistent predictor of improvement in treatment 
among prisoners (Howells et al., 2002).  Prisoners who were motivated showed 
greater improvements on anger. Contrarily, those who were poorly motivated to do so 
showed fewer or no changes. Motivational problems on the part of the participants 
have been identified by most correctional staff as a major factor of determining the 
successful of the program sessions. Howells et al. (2005) added that besides low 
effectiveness on the intervention due to the poor motivation of the prisoners, the 
content of programs being too complex for the limited program time available, low 
program integrity, and limited opportunities to practice the skills learned in the 
program. 



Another factor perhaps is the condition, physical and social environment in prison.  
Evidence suggested that setting for treatment and rehabilitation may affect the 
programme outcomes (Clarke, 1985). For example, the question must be raised 
whether the learning about anger control and expression that occur 24 hours a day in 
prison (culture abnormal) facilities or contradicts the lessons learned within 
therapeutic sessions. 
 
Howells & Day (2003) have subsequently suggested that as a group there maybe a 
number of impediments that prevent violent offenders from successfully engaging in 
treatment programs. These include the relative complexity of cases, non therapeutic 
treatment settings, dysfunctional client inferences about the nature of their problems, 
the mandatory, coercive nature of treatment, treatment incompatible personal goals, 
gender and difficulties in therapy client alliance. The combined effects of these and 
other impediments to treatment readiness may mean that it is less likely that offenders 
will accept and respond to therapeutic effort (Ward et al., 2004).  
 
This study also suffers from several limitations. First, our sample size is small; 
therefore, the findings are restricted to only male prisoners and generalizability is not 
permitted. Second, the intervention was done in a short time. The compaction and 
short time of intervention does not strengthen of learning behavior and emotion. 
Therefore, future studies should consider at least 15-20 sessions. Dowden, Blanchette 
& Serin (1999) suggested a minimum of 50 hours for general anger and 100 hours for 
extreme anger for the best results.  
 
Although this study has several limitations, our findings have suggested that anger 
and aggression are a significant issue and require further exploration. We conclude 
that the cognitive behavioral group counseling is the best therapy to reduce anger, 
especially anger state, trait, and expression-out and also on aggression. This finding 
will help correctional officers apply the effective intervention program for prisoners 
in order to reduce anger and aggression.  
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