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Abstract 
The Department of Health (DOH) reported that HIV/AIDS cases among adolescents aged 15-
21 in the Philippines are rapidly increasing. In this correspondence, the Department of 
Education (DepEd) has joined forces with the DOH and the Commission on Population and 
Development (POPCOM) to launch a government-wide response to reproductive and 
healthcare-related issues among the youth, which included the introduction of the 
Comprehensive Sexuality Education (CSE). This novel research assessed the readiness for 
CSE implementation in the context of HIV/AIDS preventive education for Senior High 
School (SHS) students from a teacher’s perspective in the Philippines. It also evaluated the 
current curriculum and policies for the implementation of a contextualized CSE. Through a 
case study design, data were gathered utilizing semi-structured online and limited face-to-
face interviews with SHS teachers at a Roman Catholic parochial co-educational institution in 
Manila, Philippines. These assessment interviews probed on the biggest barriers to 
incorporating the CSE curriculum into a teacher’s instructional modalities, as well as how 
teachers can overcome these obstacles. The researchers also explored the interventions 
needed for the implementation of CSE, as well as the impact of teaching HIV/AIDS 
preventive education to SHS students from a teacher’s point of view. Results were analyzed 
thematically drawing upon the sociological theory of structural functionalism. They are 
expected to shape the future of education in contextualized CSE and its implementation and 
continue the fight against the HIV/AIDS epidemic and its associated stigma and 
discrimination in the Philippines. 
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Introduction 
 
The Philippines is currently facing the fastest-growing HIV epidemic in Asia and the Pacific 
region by accounting for a 237% increase in annual new HIV infections from 2010 to 2020 
and a 315% increase in AIDS-related deaths during the same period, according to the 
Department of Health (DOH 2021, Table 1). Although national HIV prevalence remains 
below 0.1%, the DOH expects that the estimated number of Filipino people living with the 
virus will triple by 2030 and expand to over 330,000 in the next several years if the 
Philippines sustains its rapid increase in new infections. Most of the HIV transmissions 
recently recorded are linked to the considerably low usage of condoms and other 
contraceptives, especially among the younger age groups (DOH, 2020). Of the 82,865 
documented HIV cases from January 1984 to December 2020, 3,562 (4%) were 19 years old 
and younger at the time of diagnosis. Of these cases, 221 were children less than 10 years old, 
28 were 10-14 years old, 496 were 15-17 years old and 2,817 were 18-19 years old. In the 
last ten years, the DOH said that the percentage of HIV cases in the 15-24 age group has 
almost doubled, from 17% from 2000 to 2009 to 30% from 2010 to 2019. Additionally, 699 
of the 4,574 documented HIV-related deaths from January 1984 to December 2020 were 
males and females aged 24 and younger. 
 

Table 1. Profile and deaths related to HIV in the Philippines 

 
 
In this regard, the Department of Education (DepEd) in the Philippines has partnered with the 
DOH and the Commission on Population and Development to roll out a government-wide 
response to reproductive and healthcare-related issues among the youth (DepEd, 2018). 
Subsequently, former Philippine President Rodrigo Roa Duterte signed Executive Order 141 
in 2021 to prioritize the mobilization of government agencies and the community in 
establishing interventions for the implementation of CSE (Malacañan Palace, 2021).  The 
DepEd Order No. 31 s. 2018 seeks to curb the increasing incidences of early pregnancy, HIV 
cases, and other healthcare-related issues among Filipino children and adolescents through 
the creation of a common understanding of Comprehensive Sexuality Education (CSE). 
Currently being piloted in regions 1, 7, and 11 as mandated by the Responsible Parenthood 
and Reproductive Health Act of 2012, the DepEd Order No. 31 s. 2018 intends to ensure the 
proper implementation of CSE protocols in all public and private elementary, junior and 
senior high schools, learning centers for Special Education and Alternative Learning 
Systems, and laboratory schools of state and local universities and colleges. As part of this 
policy, teachers are expected to integrate CSE into five subjects: Music, Arts, Physical 



Education and Health; Science; Edukasyon sa Pagpapakatao (Human Ethics); Araling 
Panlipunan (Social Studies); and Personality Development. The DepEd defined CSE as a 
curriculum-based process of teaching and learning that is anchored on cognitive, emotional, 
physical, and social aspects of sexuality. It will be delivered in a scientific, age- and 
developmentally appropriate, culturally and gender-responsive, and with a rights-based 
approach. Additionally, the DepEd indicated the implementation of CSE will involve parents-
teachers-community associations, school officials, civil society organizations, and other 
interest groups. 
 
The inherent importance of the implementation of CSE has prompted researchers to probe its 
role from various perspectives and reviewed other relevant topics, such as its impact on 
students. Gallao et. al. (2020) explored the extent of Cumulative Sexual Education 
information obtained by government senior high school students and its effects on their 
sexual behavior and opinions, while Virtucio & Villafuerte (2020) focused on the influence 
of age, sex, and education strand on the knowledge on HIV/AIDS among SHS students. 
Correspondingly, Lucero (2018) stated that there is a substantial difference in the level of 
awareness and attitude of SHS students before and after conducting a health promotion 
program focusing on HIV and AIDS.  
 
Meanwhile, other researchers delved into the barriers to the implementation of CSE and 
debunked common misconceptions about them. La Bella (2014) described the opposition of 
the Catholic church, students’ readiness, and parents’ receptiveness as the biggest barriers to 
CSE implementation. Since the start of the 1990s, the Catholic Bishop’s Conference of the 
Philippines has continued its campaigns against legislation to expand condom access and 
issued personal attacks to government officials who lobbied for public sexual health 
education on the basis that these initiatives could promote promiscuity (Conde, 2016). With 
support from conservative politicians and political parties, CBSP believes that it is the 
parent’s task and not the teachers' to explain sex and relationship to their children, and that 
teaching sex education in schools will only result in unintended consequences (McGeown, 
2010). However, Baldo et. al. (1993) argued that sex does not lead to earlier or increased 
sexual activity among the youth.  
 
In terms of their readiness, La Bella (2014) also indicated that students and other key 
informants from across all ages, sex, socioeconomic status, and religion from Manila, Quezon 
City, and Biñan, Laguna are positive when it comes to integration of sex education in the 
Philippine primary and secondary public school system’s curriculum. Parental involvement 
will also be playing a pivotal role in CSE implementation (Daria & Campbell, 2004; Dwyer 
et. al., 1998) because the parents’ behaviors and parenting practices will influence their 
children’s health behaviors and decisions (Meschke et. al., 1999). More specifically, 
children’s risky behaviors will be impacted by parenting style, parents’ family management 
skills, as well as the quality of parent-child relationships. Correspondingly, Cabreros (2012) 
mentioned that most parents from grade schools in Metro Manila see sex education as a 
significant subject for school children and concurred that it should be integrated into 
academic curriculums. The result of this research is particularly important because issues 
relating to the implementation of CSE go beyond school-based limitations (Finger, 2000, as 
stated in Cabreros, 2012).  
 
However, the success of implementing CSE would still depend on teachers’ knowledge, 
skills, and attitudes that determine students’ responses and actions toward the initiative 
(Finger, 2000, as mentioned in Cabreros, 2012; Haignere & Culhane, 1996). Because of the 



pivotal role that teachers are playing in CSE implementation, as well as the lack of attention 
given to them by previous studies, this research explored their readiness for CSE 
implementation in the context of HIV/AIDS preventive education for SHS students. More 
specifically, this study evaluated the current curriculum and policies in the implementation of 
HIV/AIDS preventive education through the perspectives of SHS teachers in the Philippines.  
 
Methods 
 
- Research Design 
 
A qualitative case study method was employed to identify topics on the readiness of teachers 
when it comes to the implementation of HIV/AIDS preventive education for SHS students. It 
is also to inquire into and authenticate these subjects.  
 
- School Profile and Research Respondents 
 
Saint Anthony School is a Roman Catholic parochial educational institution and a private co-
educational institution established in 1936. The school implements the K-12 curriculum 
mandated by the DepEd and is located in Singalong St., Brgy. Malate, Manila, National 
Capital Region, the area reported the greatest number of confirmed HIV diagnoses from 
January 1984 to December 2020 with 31,058 (38%) cases (DOH 2021). 
 

Table 2. HIV cases by region in the Philippines 
 
Respondents consisted of randomly selected teachers specializing in Music, Arts, Physical 
Education and Health, Science, Edukasyon sa Pagpapakatao (Human Ethics), Araling 
Panlipunan (Social Studies), and Personality Development, which are the five subject areas 
that the DepEd wants to integrate CSE in its nationwide implementation. Out of the 25 
teachers from Saint Anthony School, only 8 of them were able to participate in this study.   
 
- Data Gathering and Analysis 
 
Data were gathered through semi-structured interviews. They were mostly conducted via 
video conferencing applications such as Zoom, Facebook Messenger Rooms, and Google 
Meet or through an online questionnaire using Google Forms due to the rules and restrictions 
still imposed by the COVID-19 pandemic. Most of the interviews were done during the 
weekends and some during the teachers’ free time on weekdays. To invite additional 
participants for this study, the authors also personally visited Saint Anthony School to 



conduct face-to-face interviews concerning the educational institution’s COVID-19 health 
and safety protocols.  
 
The structure of the interview is segmented into three primary parts. The first few questions 
centered on teachers’ perspectives on the current CSE curriculum of Saint Anthony School, 
as well as its enacted policies for the implementation of CSE in the context of HIV/AIDS 
preventive education. The second set of questions focused on assessing the readiness of 
teachers on teaching topics related to HIV/AIDS. In particular, the researchers probed on the 
perceived barriers to incorporating HIV/AIDS preventive education into the lesson plans of 
teachers at Saint Anthony School, and how they can overcome these obstacles. The final part 
of the interview focused on the interventions required to improve the readiness of teachers in 
teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education, as well as on their perceived impact of educating 
their SHS students on such knowledge domain. 
 
The results of the interviews were transcribed and analyzed using thematic analysis methods. 
Furthermore, structural functionalism was adopted to analyze and authenticate the validity of 
analyzed themes on teacher readiness for teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education. 
Structural functionalism sees education as a crucial and essential institution that serves to 
provide several benefits or functions to society such as socialization, social placement, as 
well as social and cultural innovation.  
 
Results and Discussion 
 
The results of the research are specifically subdivided into three themes drawing upon the 
questions provided by the researchers to the study population. Additionally, each theme will 
be followed by a discussion to allow the researchers to fully evaluate and validate their 
authenticity.  
 
1. Current CSE curriculum in the context of HIV/AIDS preventive education for 
SHS students and its implementation policies 
 
Teachers revealed that Saint Anthony School’s current academic curriculum does not include 
or has not yet included propositions mandated by the DepEd Order No. 31 s. 2018, which 
intends to integrate CSE in Music, Arts, Physical Education and Health, Science, Edukasyon 
sa Pagpapakatao (Values Education), Araling Panlipunan (Social Studies), and Personality 
Development subjects among SHS students in the Philippines. As they are still not mandated 
by their educational institution, the SHS teachers said that they have not integrated CSE in 
any of the subjects they are teaching to their students, including specific concepts and topics 
pertinent to the prevention of HIV/AIDS. Some teachers elaborated that their school has not 
yet instructed them to integrate CSE in their lesson plans because their educational institution 
is still following the DepEd’s basic education curriculum, which is only focusing on teaching 
students the basics of reading, writing, arithmetic, science, and patriotism. These same 
teachers added with an uncertainty that the integration of CSE, especially in the context of 
HIV/AIDS preventive education, is only or currently required in senior high schools within 
colleges and universities. 
 
Consequently, the teachers indicated that their school has no policies currently in place for 
the implementation of CSE in the context of HIV/AIDS preventive education for SHS 
students. Thus, there is no clear indication of whether they are permitted or not to incorporate 
topics about HIV/AIDS in their lesson plans. 



The teachers also showed a lack of awareness of the implementation of CSE. Some of them 
are not informed about DepEd’s cooperation with the DOH and POPCOM to create an action 
plan to address reproductive and healthcare-related issues among the youth, which included 
the implementation of CSE in public and private elementary, junior and senior high schools, 
as well as other educational institutions in the Philippines. One teacher attributed this lack of 
awareness of the implementation of CSE to their school’s Christian faith formation. While 
others have heard or read about the DepEd Order No. 31 s. 2018 before social media, most 
teachers are not yet fully familiar with or lack relevant information about the memorandum, 
especially as to where it is currently piloted, when it be enforced in the National Capital 
Region, and how it will take effect in their school.  
 
2. Readiness of teachers to teach HIV/AIDS preventive education to SHS students 
 
Most of the teachers expressed readiness to integrate CSE in their lesson plans, as well as 
willingness to teach concepts related to the prevention of HIV/AIDS. While some also 
expressed ambivalence when it comes to their confidence and authority to teach sensitive 
topics, they all agreed that a critical component to their readiness in teaching HIV/AIDS 
prevention education to their SHS students is preparation and planning. According to the 
teachers, they need to identify the learning objectives before they integrate the CSE 
curriculum in the context of HIV/AIDS preventive education into their respective lesson 
plans. One teacher mentioned, “this matter must be presented first to the faculty and all 
instructor(s). Afterward, through collaboration among the coordinators and teachers, we will 
devise strategies on how to integrate it into our curriculum implementation.” Generally, the 
teachers believe that an effective and efficient learning objective will describe what their 
students are expected to learn and how will they apply those learnings in the future rather 
than just what their students will be exposed to during classes. The teachers also emphasized 
the importance of identifying the specific learning activities that would expose their students 
to relevant information regarding the prevention of HIV/AIDS.  
 
The majority of the teachers agreed that time management is an important factor to consider 
when identifying learning activities to provide each topic the appropriate attention they need 
and to allow students to fully understand concepts that they are not familiar with. Teachers 
must also allocate extra time for extended explanation or discussion, especially if students are 
having a hard time understanding a complex concept. By allocating appropriate time to each 
topic, most of the teachers believe that it will help them avoid “watering down” the 
importance of a particular topic related to the prevention of HIV/AIDS. Lastly, the teachers 
concurred that they must assess student understanding, by giving them quizzes and practical 
tests or examinations. They believe that these assessments would allow their students to 
demonstrate their new knowledge and skills as stated in the learning objectives. Assessments 
will also allow teachers to offer additional coaching and mentoring that can guide further 
learning for their students. Some of the teachers also mentioned that assessment can provide 
them with an idea if their lesson plans and instructional modalities are successful or not. 
 
Moreover, teachers have recognized religion as the biggest barrier to adopting the CSE 
curriculum and teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education to their SHS students. Since their 
educational institution is primarily Roman Catholic, almost all the teachers are concerned 
about preserving their school’s conservative core values, as well as on how they would 
approach the topic of HIV/AIDS with added sensibility and sensitivity in comparison to 
schools that are not affiliated with a religious organization. One teacher said teaching 
HIV/AIDS preventive education “is a worldwide issue and the church needs to be involved to 



prevent future moral dilemma.” Several teachers have also highlighted students’ readiness to 
receive HIV/AIDS preventive education as they might still not have the same maturity as 
those students at the tertiary level to understand sensitive topics and concepts. Few teachers 
are also perplexed as to how teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education will impact their 
students who came from a more conservative background and with still naïve attitudes. 
Parental receptiveness is also seen as an obstacle to embedding the CSE curriculum in the 
context of HIV/AID prevention into the core SHS subjects. Several of the teachers expressed 
fear and anxiety as to how parents will react if they learn that their children are receiving 
HIV/AIDS preventive education, especially those with traditional or old-fashioned thinking. 
Almost all the teachers said that they are afraid that parents might blame them if something 
bad happens to their children and if parents will accuse them of corrupting their children’s 
characters, as well as “perverting” their behavioral patterns on sex and human relationships. 
 
When it comes to overcoming barriers in teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education to their 
SHS students, many of the teachers underscored the significance of having an open mind. 
One teacher elaborated that open-mindedness would provide her with some “creative 
freedom” to create new strategies in teaching sensitive topics relevant to HIV/AIDS. An open 
mind will also allow teachers to fully understand and analyze HIV/AIDS-related topics and 
concepts that they might not be particularly interested in, according to some teachers. They 
emphasized that teachers must first be able to establish the importance of teaching HIV/AIDS 
education within themselves because it is the only way they can successfully fulfill DepEd’s 
CSE implementation. Apart from open-mindedness, subject matter knowledge, and teachers’ 
ability to establish a supportive and safe learning environment among their students. 
Additionally, some teachers noted that students nowadays are very “sensitive” and that they 
can easily feel if their teachers are not confident in the topics they are teaching. They added 
that a teacher’s impartiality in his or her lesson plans and instructional modalities will 
negatively affect students’ learning ability and their capacity to respond and react to sensitive 
topics tackled in HIV/AIDS preventive education.  
 
While others shed a light on the important qualities a teacher must have in teaching 
HIV/AIDS preventive education, several teachers highlighted the importance of opening a 
dialogue or creating conversations regarding gender and sexuality to create a common 
understanding of their definition. Several of them have also suggested social studies teachers 
intensify the teaching of gender and sexuality among their students and then connect the 
impact and importance of these two talking points to the issue of HIV/AIDS. By introducing 
these key points first, one teacher explained that “we can ensure that we are doing our job as 
teachers slowly but surely.” Another teacher elaborated that bringing in discussions about 
sexuality and gender will ensure students will not be surprised as they tackle more sensitive 
topics about HIV/AIDS. Furthermore, several teachers see the significance of “normalizing” 
discourse on syphilis, gonorrhea, chlamydia, and other sexually transmitted infections (STIs) 
as they too are still “taboo” topics much like HIV and AIDS. Alongside parental guidance, 
teachers said that it is their responsibility as second parents of their students to make them 
feel safe and secure when asking questions about sensitive topics and concepts associated 
with the prevention of HIV/AIDS or other STIs. 
 
Concerning fostering open-mindedness, confidence, a sense of authority, and credibility, as 
well as promoting the practice of favorably perceived norms, all teachers agreed that several 
interventions are needed in the implementation of CSE, especially in the context of 
HIV/AIDS preventive education. They all shared a similar perspective on the importance of 
the unification of parents, students, and the school to avoid “awkward treatment” on this 



matter. One teacher stated that all stakeholders must reach a consensus to assure the 
effectiveness and appropriateness of subject matters and messages that will be integrated with 
the lesson plans for teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education. Another teacher noted that 
parent-teacher meetings could be conducted to talk about updates regarding student learning 
and review feedback on instructional modalities.  
 
Additionally, some teachers accentuated the significance of government intervention in the 
integration of HIV/AIDS preventive education into the lesson plan. They believe that DepEd 
should encourage community participation in the creation of a new lesson plan for students. 
One teacher suggested schools partner with their local government units or DOH-accredited 
HIV/AIDS treatment hubs and clinics to improve the knowledge and awareness of students 
on the topic of HIV/AIDS. The same teacher also said that schools should allow DOH-
accredited civil society organizations and other DOH-recognized non-profit organizations 
such as Love Yourself Inc. to conduct HIV testing and counseling for students from time to 
time. Screenings for other sexually transmitted infections should also be permitted by schools 
if they are conducted by organizations with accreditation from DOH to students of legal age, 
according to the same teacher. She added that teachers can also test for HIV and other STIs to 
be a good example to their students. Several teachers agreed on the pivotal role they are 
playing in removing the stigma of HIV and STI testing. They believe that these screenings 
should be encouraged constantly by parents and teachers, especially for sexually active 
students. Some teachers also believed that HIV and STI testing should be branded as a “self-
care” practice so students can live long and healthy lives.  
 
Accordingly, many of the teachers are expecting to receive additional training and recurring 
seminars or conferences organized by their school in conjunction with the DepEd or DOH on 
topics and concepts about the prevention of HIV/AIDS. They emphasized that not all of them 
are subject matter experts on HIV/AIDS so it would be helpful for teachers and beneficial to 
students if the DepEd can create a common language as to how they should integrate the key 
messages on the lesson plans. Several teachers also emphasized the importance of the DOH 
to establish best practices for teaching sensitive topics regarding HIV/AIDS. At least three 
teachers also believed that they should be given an allowance or additional compensation for 
teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education considering that it is outside the scope of their 
specialization and would require extra time and effort from their “routine.” A salary increase 
would also permit them to purchase additional materials and acquire the required resources in 
learning HIV/AIDS so they can teach it to their students with more credibility and reliability, 
according to the teachers.  
 
3.  Perceived impact and implications of teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education 
to SHS students 
 
Most teachers believe that teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education if done right, will 
positively impact the lives of their students. They are hoping that allowing their students to 
learn more about HIV/AIDS will not generate fear or stop them from engaging in sexual acts 
but help them make more informed decisions. The majority of the interviewed SHS teachers 
are also assuming that teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education would encourage their 
students to always be mindful of the consequences of their actions, especially around their 
sexual and reproductive health. Overall, the teachers are expecting their students to reduce 
risky behaviors when it comes to sex through increased usage of contraception, as well as 
improve their health-seeking behaviors. One teacher said that teaching HIV/AIDS preventive 
education could not only improve his students’ understanding of sexual and reproductive 



health problems but also enhance their coping mechanisms if one of them will be diagnosed 
with any related illnesses. Another interviewed teacher stated that he wants his students to 
share their learnings and takeaways about the prevention of HIV/AIDS from the classroom 
with their family and friends at home to “destigmatized” conversations around the topic of 
sexual and reproductive health, most especially among the conservative younger generation.  
 
Furthermore, many teachers expressed optimism as they strongly believe that teaching 
HIV/AIDS to their students could remove the stigma around the contagious virus. Apart from 
spreading awareness of HIV/AIDS to their students, teachers also aim to promote more 
empathy and foster compassion, especially for those people who are suffering from the 
infectious virus. One teacher said that teaching topics centering around the prevention of 
HIV/AIDS could be her “own little way” of helping her many friends from the LGBTQIA+ 
community. More specifically, she said that incorporating CSE in the context of HIV/AIDS 
preventive education into her lesson plans could be an “excellent and exciting opportunity” 
for her to correct the wrongful assertion that portrays the infectious disease as a “gay plague.”  
 
Conclusion 
 
Research revealed that amplifying awareness of the implementation of CSE, intensifying self-
efficacy of teachers in teaching topics and concepts with relevance to the prevention of 
HIV/AIDS, as well as magnifying community-based interventions and social encouragement 
are the most important factors in improving the readiness of teachers. The researchers believe 
that the synergy of these significant variables to improve the preparedness of teachers in 
teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education will result in the expected outcomes or help obtain 
the objectives of the RH Law, DepEd Order No. 31 s. 2018, and PRRD’s EO 12. Moreover, 
the synergy of these independent yet interrelated facets to enhance teacher readiness for 
teaching HIV/AIDS preventive education can also inform the impact and implications of 
teaching other contextualized CSE from across primary, secondary, and tertiary educational 
levels. Thereby, this synergy has the potential to reshape the landscape of the current 
educational system in the Philippines, as well as redefine the future of teaching and learning 
in the country.   
 
Moreover, the researchers also recognize the obstacles in organizing and managing relevant 
efforts to fortify the preparedness of teachers when it comes to incorporating HIV/AIDS-
related topics and concepts into their lesson plans or instructional modalities; hence, 
proactive, and reactive participation from all stakeholders, as well as public cooperation, is 
required based on research results and discussions. After all, and as posited by previous 
academic studies, implementing HIV/AIDS preventive education, as well as addressing both 
constraints and restraints of administering a contextualized CSE goes beyond the classroom, 
as they should also be tackled at home and in the community. 
 
The authors of this study strongly suggest five significant directions other scholars may take 
if they would like to specifically delve into the same subject area as ours. Since this study 
only focused on the perspective of teachers from one school that is essentially a private, 
Roman Catholic parochial co-educational institution, other researchers can center their 
exploration on the point of view of other teachers from other public schools or government, 
single-sex, nonsectarian schools. Other researchers may also focus their analyses on the 
viewpoints of teachers from provincial schools, especially those located outside of the 
National Capital Region or from far-flung places in Visayas and Mindanao. Similarly, future 



studies may examine the readiness of teachers to teach contextualized CSE in schools located 
in regions with low HIV/AIDS cases.  
 
In addition, this research anticipates the need for other scholars to probe teachers’ readiness 
in teaching other STIs, including chlamydia, genital herpes, genital warts, gonorrhea, and 
some types of hepatitis, syphilis, and trichomoniasis. By specifically targeting any of the five 
directions that the authors of this study suggested, other scholars can contribute to deepening 
the understanding of human social development as fostered by a contextualized CSE. These 
scholars can also help broaden the understanding of the enabling and disabling aspects of the 
current landscape of the Philippine educational system. The proposed topics can also allow 
other researchers to provide evidence-based recommendations that promote improvements 
and advocate innovations within the systematic framework of Filipino educational 
institutions. Other researchers can similarly produce recommendations that can potentially 
tackle existing limitations of the Philippine educational system, as well as address its current 
conundrums and other pending dilemmas. Finally, the authors of this study believe that the 
five directions highlighted above can fundamentally bring new and meaningful insights that 
can pave the way for the future of learning and teaching in the Philippines.  
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